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Notice Concerning Commencement of Tender Offer for Axis 
  
On February 10, 2015, Canon Inc. (the “Company”) announced plans to commence a 
public tender offer for the shares of Axis AB (“Axis”) (the “Tender Offer”). On February 
27, 2015, the Swedish Financial Supervisory Authority and Nasdaq Stockholm both 
approved the offering memorandum regarding the Tender Offer. With this, the Tender 
Offer for Axis will commence from March 3, 2015 as follows. 
  
  
  
1. Offer Price : 340 Swedish krona per ordinary share 
2. Offer Period : From March 3, 2015 to April 1, 2015 
    (In the event that tender offer conditions are not fulfilled, 
    the Company can extend the Offer Period) 
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The Tender Offer is not being and will not be made, directly or indirectly, in or into, or by 
use of mail or any other means or instrumentality of interstate or foreign commerce of, or 
any facilities of a national securities exchange of, Australia, Hong Kong, Japan, Canada, 
New Zealand, South Africa or the United States (the “Excluded Jurisdictions”). This 
includes, but is not limited to facsimile transmission, electronic mail, telex, telephone, the 
internet and other forms of electronic transmission. The Tender Offer cannot be accepted 
and shares may not be tendered in the Tender Offer by any such use, means, 
instrumentality or facility of, or from within the Excluded Jurisdictions or by persons 
located or resident in the Excluded Jurisdictions. Accordingly, this notice and any related 
Tender Offer documentation are not being and should not be mailed or otherwise 
transmitted, distributed, forwarded or sent in or into the Excluded Jurisdictions or to any  
Excluded Jurisdiction person or any persons located or resident in an Excluded 
Jurisdiction. 
  
Any purported tender of shares in the Tender Offer resulting directly or indirectly from a 
violation of these restrictions will be invalid and any purported tender of shares made by a 
person located in an Excluded Jurisdiction or any agent fiduciary or other intermediary 
acting on a non-discretionary basis for a principal giving instructions from within an 
Excluded Jurisdiction will be invalid and will not be accepted.  Each holder of shares 
participating in the Tender Offer will represent that it is not an Excluded Jurisdiction 
person, is not located in an Excluded Jurisdiction and is not participating in such Tender 
Offer from an Excluded Jurisdiction or that it is acting on a non-discretionary basis for a 
principal that is not an Excluded Jurisdiction person, that is located outside an Excluded 
Jurisdiction and that is not giving an order to participate in such offer from an Excluded 
Jurisdiction. Canon will not deliver any consideration from the Tender Offer into an 
Excluded Jurisdiction. 


